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INDIANAPOLIS - September 6, 2012 - Course Networking 
(theCN.com) and Hue University signed an MOU creating a CN 
Satellite Campus in Viet Nam.  
 
CourseNetworking identified Hue University as the first in a series 
of higher education campuses around the world that will be 
chosen for the establishment of national and regional CN Satellite 
Offices. Serving as the first CN Satellite Campus in the world and 
the only in Viet Nam, Hue University will provide facilities and 
human resources to serve as the liaison between the campus, 
country and the CN headquarters in Indianapolis, Indiana.  
 
As a CN Satellite Campus, Hue University will provide insights to 
theCN.com about how to best serve the student, faculty, and 
university populations in Viet Nam through academic social 
networking, how to most effectively recruit users in the region, 
and they will provide training to faculty and students.  
 
Of the partnership, Dr. Huynh Dinh Chien, Director of the 
Learning Resource Center and faculty of medicine, said: "As the 
only Satellite Campus of CourseNetworking for the whole country 
of Viet Nam, Hue University Learning Resource Center considers 
the signing of this MOU as one of her hallmark events. Through 
Course Networking, students and faculty of Hue University, in 
particular, and of Viet Nam, in general, will be part of the world's 
vast community of online learners and instructors, and their 
immense resources. Our local classrooms will become more 
global than ever before. I am convinced that the strong 
partnership between Hue University and CourseNetworking will 
bring meaningful benefits to all."  
 
"It is a great pleasure for CourseNetworking to develop this 



partnership between Hue University and theCN.com. As our first 
Satellite Campus, Hue University, a leading higher education 
institution in Viet Nam, will provide valuable insight for 
theCN.com in refining its product for countries all over the world. 
We look forward to advancing global education together" said Dr. 
Ali Jafari, CEO and creator of theCN.com.  
 
About Hue University 
Hue University is a unique multi-disciplinary institution, focused 
on educating scientific and administrative professionals who are 
prepared to address the economic needs of the region. The 
institution is home to numerous research centers, and it provides 
academic training in 90 undergraduate degree areas and 83 
graduate and post-graduate programs.  
 
About CourseNetworking 
CourseNetworking (theCN.com) is an academic social networking 
site that empowers learning throughout the world--free to all 
users. TheCN.com supports classroom teaching and learning 
practices and can be used as a complement to existing Learning 
Management Systems or as a primary learning environment for 
classroom based, hybrid, distance learning and MOOC courses.  
 
For more information, please contact Sarah Zike, Director of 
Business Development for CourseNetworking, at 
sarah@coursenetworking.com or 317-550-2020.  


